
 

ONLINE AUDITION RULES & GUIDELINES 
 

● The medium for casting or audition for artists based out of United 
States will be Skype. This can also apply to artists living in USA 
depending on the availability of the casting manager/director and 
prior approval. 

● The artist participating in the online casting or audition should be 
over the age of 18 on the date of the audition.  

● The artist shall provide proof of her age. In case where the artist 
has not provided the proof of her age, the artist agrees to take full 
responsibility of her actions. 

● The artist is entirely entitled to ask for proof from the casting 
manager/director to prove he/she has been appointment by the 
production company to conduct the casting or 
audition(authorisation letter). 

● During initial rounds of the online casting or audition the video and 
audio of the casting manager/director shall be made unavailable to 
the artist during live audition to maintain and protect confidentiality 
of the casting manager/director and the production company and 
because of recent issues with stalkers and lawsuits. 

● The one time audition fees for artists who are not registered under 
a reputed representative as recognised by the production company 
or for artists who have not been a part of a Hollywood feature film 
before will be at the tune of $100. The same will be adjusted in the 
payment due from the company towards the artist. The artist may 
however not be charged based on recommendation of the casting 
manager. 

● The fees is not applicable to artists who have participated in online 
casting or audition by casting manager/director of the production 
company before if they provide proof of the same. 



● The casting manager/director has full right and jurisdiction ask the 
artist to perform things pertaining to the role during the 
casting/audition. 

● The casting director shall maintain professionality during the 
audition or casting at all times and circumstances.  

● Any cases of harassment can persuaded by either the artist or the 
casting director with jurisdiction of the constitution of United States 
American under Civil Rights Act Of 1964. 

● The casting manager/director has the right to cancel the audition at 
any point of time without citing reason for the same. 

● The casting manager/director has full right to deny the role to the 
artist without citing reason for the same. 

● The casting manager/director must maintain confidentiality of the 
details of the artist provided casting/audition which would include 
Audio, video and texted conversations. 

● The artist at all times shall maintain confidentiality of the audition or 
casting pertaining to all the details of the film.  

● The role can be obtained only based on skills/talent of the artist. If 
there is any act of persuading the casting manager/director with 
means other than acting skills/talent of the artist, that would lead to 
eventual cancellation of the role depending of further enquiry. 

 


